
Course Overview

Methodology and tools
training are combined with
realistic project simulation
for a high-impact learning
experience. Guided by the
philosophy that 85% of all
quality problems can be
solved by focusing on the
process, 1st PASS (Process
Advancement Skills
Simulation) employs a
methodology and tool set
which includes Deming's
PDCA (Plan, Do, Check,
Act) cycle, Continuous
Process Improvement (CPI),
Statistical process Control
(SPC), and Business Process
Reinvention (BPR)
techniques. Participants
work in teams of 5-7 people
to identify and implement
process improvements to a
simulated business process.

Course Features

Increase enthusiasm,
commitment, and
confidence to apply process
improvement techniques and
skills in the everyday
working environment.

Gain knowledge and an
understanding of the quality
improvement philosophy.

Develop skill level in using

the basic tools of quality

improvement.

Specifications

Course Length
3 days

Audience
Anyone who will participate
in a continuous process
improvement project or
evaluate process
improvement results should
attend. We highly
recommend sending actual
teams who will be working
together on process
improvement following the
event.

Prerequisites
None

Delivery Method
Classroom

Format
Course content is 40%
lecture and 6 0% team
work.

Classroom Training
Benefits

Experienced HP Instructors
Learn from an HP instructor
experienced in leading this
highly interactive class.

Available at HP
Classrooms
Take advantage of HP's
learning facilities,
equipment, and interactive
learning environment by
attending class at an HP
facility.

Regularly Scheduled
Classes
Plan training months in
advance.

Extensive Hands-on
Practice
HP classroom training is
characterized by extensive
hands-on experience and
interactive class discussion.
HP classroom training pays
off immediately because it is
geared to real-world
solutions.

Comprehensive Student
Materials
Copies of course materials
are provided for future
reference on the job.
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Course Agenda

Quality: what is it?

Customer satisfaction: why

is it important?

Continuous process

improvement: how is it

done?

Request for quote simulation

(throughout event)

Process analysis tools

Issue statements

Process flow diagrams

Process performance

measures

Cause and effect

Data collection

Charts (pareto)

Frequency distribution

Control charts

Documentation

Presenting results to

management

Barriers to team

effectiveness

Stages of team development

Team task and maintenance

skills

Ordering Information

To order 1st PASS (H8702C)
course in the U.S. call
1-800-HPCLASS
(800-472-5277).

HP's Customer Registration
Center can provide you with
price, scheduling, and
enrollment information, as
well as provide information
about a dedicated delivery
(H8702Y) or customizing a
course for your specific
needs.

Outside the U.S., contact
your nearest local HP sales
office.

Region Sales Headquarters:

United States:

Hewlett-Packard Company

Test and Measurement Organization

5301 Stevens Creek Blvd.

Bldg. 51L-SC

Santa Clara, CA 95052-8059

(408) 246-4300

Canada:

Hewlett-Packard Ltd.

5150 Spectrum Way

Mississauga, Ontario L4W 5G1

(905) 206-4725

European Headquarters:

Hewlett-Packard S.A.

150, Route du Nant d'Avril

1217 Meyrin 2 - Geneva, Switzerland

(41) 22/780 8111

Japan:

Hewlett-Packard Japan Ltd.

NAF Bldg.

3-8-20 Takaido-higasi

Suginami-ku

Tokyo 168

(03) 3335-8111

Latin America:

Latin America Region Headquarters

Monte Pelvoux No. 111

Lomas de Chapultepec

11000 Mexico, D.F. Mexico

(525) 202 0155

Australia/New Zealand:

Hewlett-Packard Australia Ltd.

31-41 Joseph Street, Blackburn

Victoria 3130, Melbourne, Australia

(03) 895-2895

Far East:

Hewlett-Packard Asia Ltd.

17-21/F Shell Tower, Times Square

1 Matheson Street, Causeway Bay

Hong Kong

(852) 2506-9285
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